
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 16-0026

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Sulfuric Acid

FOR: (Date of Award through May 31, 2017)

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 11, 2016
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

PRODUCT A Heating & Cooling        

46 Tote UNIT  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

220 gallon tote PRICE 1,135.20

1. 92% Sulfuric Acid TOTAL 52,219.20      

Heating & Cooling        

15 drums UNIT  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15 gallon drum PRICE 77.40

2. 92% Sulfuric Acid TOTAL 1,161.00      

Heating & Cooling

400 gallons        

120 gallon containers*        

92% Sulfuric Acid UNIT

*SAWS Headquarters has two building each with one (1) 120 gal container with containment PRICE 5.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 that will need to be filled as needed TOTAL 2,064.00      

  *      

        

 TOTAL TOTAL 55,444.20      

PRODUCT B Desal UNIT       

228,000 gallons PRICE No Bid 1.101 1.1858 1.2003 1.377 1.64

1. 93% Sulfuric Acid TOTAL  251,028.00 270,362.40 273,668.40 313,956.00 373,920.00

   *

     

 TOTAL TOTAL  251,028.00 270,362.40 273,668.40 313,956.00 373,920.00

EXTENSION 1 55,444.20 251,028.00

EXTENSION 2 55,444.20 251,028.00

EXTENSION 3 55,444.20 251,028.00

Net Net Net Net Net Net

 Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

 

Delivery Schedule     

 

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 Bell Chemical Noah Tech Demandstar

Brenntag Southwest Inc. PVS Mini Bulk SAWS Website

Continental Chemical USA Rowell Chemical

DS Supplies Seidler Chemicals

DXI Industries Inc. Univar

FSTI, Inc. Wrico Corp.

GAC Chemical
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